
     Arts & Learning Opportunities and Connections to School Curriculum 
    On-Line Resources for Teachers and Students 

             Kindergarten to Grade 12 

 

Music (Discipline)  Image                       Organization                      Description    URL 

 
 
Band, Choir, 
General Music 

 

 
 
Saskatchewan 
Music Educators 
Association 
 

 
 
Covid-19 Safety in the Music 
Classroom (All Grades) 

www.saskmea.ca 
 
https://saskmea.ca/wp/wp-
content/uploads/2020/08/SMEA-
COVID-GUIDELINES-AUG-21-
2020.pdf 
 

 

     

 

Dance (Discipline)  Image                            Organization                      Description    URL 

 
HipHop Hoop 
Dance 
 

  
 
HIPHOP HOOP 
DANCE 

World champion hoop dancer 
Terrance Littletent collaborates 
with interdisciplinary artist 
Chancz Perry to produce a cross-
cultural fusion of First Nations 
hoop dance and North American 
hip hop.  Both engaging 
performers share an historical, 
educational and inspirational 
outlook of the two dance genres. 

 
 

www.hiphophoopdance.
ca  
 
https://www.youtube.com/watch
?v=amcon5WCBLQ 
 
 
 

 

http://www.saskmea.ca/
https://saskmea.ca/wp/wp-content/uploads/2020/08/SMEA-COVID-GUIDELINES-AUG-21-2020.pdf
https://saskmea.ca/wp/wp-content/uploads/2020/08/SMEA-COVID-GUIDELINES-AUG-21-2020.pdf
https://saskmea.ca/wp/wp-content/uploads/2020/08/SMEA-COVID-GUIDELINES-AUG-21-2020.pdf
https://saskmea.ca/wp/wp-content/uploads/2020/08/SMEA-COVID-GUIDELINES-AUG-21-2020.pdf
http://www.hiphophoopdance.ca/
http://www.hiphophoopdance.ca/
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=amcon5WCBLQ
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=amcon5WCBLQ


     

Visual (Discipline)  Image                            Organization                      Description    URL 

 
ceramic, 
photography, 
textiles, video, 
and more. 

  
Organization of 
Saskatchewan 
Arts Councils 
 

A comprehensive education guide 
created to develop visual literacy 
and enhance the experience of 
visual art; specifically the 
exhibition The Flower May Not 
Look Like the Roots. Keywords: 
Identity, Landscape, Place, 
Saskatchewan Artists, Ecology.  
(K-12) 

 
 
https://www.osac.ca/images/VA/
PDFs/FlowerEdGuide.pdf 

 

 
 
Painting 

 
 

 
 
Organization of 
Saskatchewan 
Arts Councils 

A comprehensive education guide 
created to develop visual literacy 
and enhance the experience of 
visual art; specifically the 
exhibition Common Truths: 
Donna Langhorne. Keywords: 
Anishinaabe, Plains Ojibway, 
Woodland Style, Indigenous Art, 
Truth and Reconciliation  

 

 
 
https://www.osac.ca/images/VA/
PDFs/CommonTruthsEdGuide.pdf 

 

     

 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

https://www.osac.ca/images/VA/PDFs/FlowerEdGuide.pdf
https://www.osac.ca/images/VA/PDFs/FlowerEdGuide.pdf
https://www.osac.ca/images/VA/PDFs/CommonTruthsEdGuide.pdf
https://www.osac.ca/images/VA/PDFs/CommonTruthsEdGuide.pdf


 
 
Litercy (Discipline)  Image                            Organization                      Description    URL 

 
Author Reading 
Program- ELA, 
Creative Writing, 
Social Studies 
(Help to provide a 
sense of self, 
community, and 
place) 

 

  
Saskatchewan 
Writers Guild 
 

The SWG Author Readings 
Program makes it possible for 
people of all ages to meet and 
listen to their favourite 
Saskatchewan authors and 
storytellers through this 
subsidized reading program. 
Readings can occur in-person or 
online. (In-person readings must 
follow government and school 
guidelines.) In addition to reading 
from their published work, 
authors may also speak about life 
as an author, idea creation, the 
writing or publishing process, or 
other topics that align with 
curriculum. (K-12) 

 

 
 
 
 
https://skwriter.com/programs-
and-services/author-readings-
program 
 

 

Windscript 
Magazine- ELA, 
Creative Writing, 
Social Studies 
(Help to provide a 
sense of self, 
community, and 
place and create 
engaged citizens) 
 

 

  
 
Saskatchewan 
Writers Guild 

Windscript has been publishing 
the best of Saskatchewan high 
school students’ literature since 
1983. Each year, students submit 
poetry or prose to the magazine 
(by January 15) for a chance to be 
published. Students receive 2 
copies of the magazine and $30 
upon publication as well as the 
opportunity to participate in a 
magazine launch in May. (Grades 
9-12) 

 
www.skwriter.com/programs-
and-
services/publications/windscript  

 

 

https://skwriter.com/programs-and-services/author-readings-program
https://skwriter.com/programs-and-services/author-readings-program
https://skwriter.com/programs-and-services/author-readings-program
http://www.skwriter.com/programs-and-services/publications/windscript
http://www.skwriter.com/programs-and-services/publications/windscript
http://www.skwriter.com/programs-and-services/publications/windscript


Drama (Discipline)  Image                            Organization                      Description    URL 

 
 

  
 
 

  
 

 

     

 

Media (Discipline)  Image                            Organization                      Description    URL 

 
 

  
 
 

  
 

 

     

     

 
Interdisciplinary (Discipline)  Image               Organization                      Description    URL 

 
 

  
 
 

  
 

 

     

 

Craft (Discipline)  Image                            Organization                      Description    URL 

 
 

  
 
 

  
 

 

     

 

Other (Discipline)  Image                            Organization                      Description    URL 

 
 

  
 
 

  
 

 



     

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


